Bidder: Knife River

Bidder: River Bend

Bidder: CEMEX

Houck Construction

PRICES FOR;: “Asphalt Concrete | Plant #9 Sand & Gravel PO Box 12009 Materials, Inc.
and Aspha|t Cements” 9710 Wheatland PO Box 12095 Salem OR 97309 4444 22nd Ave NE
DATE: July 1, 2011 — June 30, Salem OR 97303 Salem OR 97309 Rick Vincent Salem OR 97301
2012 Warren Johnson Ric Linares Ph. 585-5911 Roy Houck I
Ph: 390-6955 Ph: 363-9281 Ph: 463-7177
ITEM UNIT PRICE / TON UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Price Per Ton
1. Level 3, 3/4" Dense
; 42. 44. 46. :
MHMAC $ 50 $ 00 $ 46.00 $ 50.00
2. Level 2, 1/2" Dense
MHMAC $ 44.00 $ 45.50 $ 46.00 $ 50.00
3. Level 2, 3/8" Dense
MHMAC $ 55.50 $ 54.50 $ 46.25 $ 56.00
4. Level 1 “D"-Mix (2-Bin)
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete NO BID $ 62.50 $ 56.00 NO BID
5. HFE (State) Cold Mix $ 90.00 NO BID $ 98.00 NO BID
6. PG 64-22 Asphalt Cement | ¢575 09 $610.00 $620.00 $590.00
(heated)
7. PG 70-22 Asphalt Cement
(heated) $600.00 $625.00 NO BID $620.00
8. CSS-1 (Bitumal) Asphalt
Cement $550.00 $600.00 $620.00 $590.00
9. CSS-2 (Bitumal) Asphalt NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cement
10.AR-4000 (Tack Coat) Asphalt NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cement

Plant Location

9710 Wheatland Rd N
Salem, OR 97303

4105 Lancaster Dr SE
Salem, OR 97301

1815 22" St. SE
Salem, OR 97302

4444 22" Ave NE
Salem, OR 97301

Delivery Available No No No No

Delivery Charge N/A N/A N/A N/A
Stand-By Charge N/A N/A N/A N/A
Stand-By Time until charged N/A N/A N/A N/A
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